
 

* The Tinley Park-Park District is an Equal Opportunity Employer. 

 
NOW HIRING: Personal Trainer (part-time) 
   
JOB SUMMARY:  The Personal Trainer is a self-motivated individual who is client-
driven and maintains a professional work ethic. The Personal Trainer will be 
responsible for organizing his/her own program designs within the client’s scope of 
ability and goals, while utilizing the proper techniques, appropriate exercises, and 
correct equipment. Personal Trainers must adhere to all guidelines and expectations 
of the Tinley Fitness Personal Training Programs. 
  
LOCATION:  Tinley Fitness Center, 8125 W. 171st Street, Tinley Park, IL  
  
QUALIFICATIONS:  The qualified individual should be able to communicate 
effectively with adults and youth. Certification from an accredited certifying body is 
required, and specialty certification (TRX/Tabata/Kettleballs/etc..) for small group 
training or training class is preferred. Training auditions will be required for 
evaluation of qualifications prior to employment. Current CPR certification or ability 
to gain CPR certified is required. 
 

INCENTIVES:  This is a year-round, part-time position with up to 19 hours per week, 
depending on client load and need. Flexible availability is preferred, including hours 
during the day and evening on weekdays and weekends. Opportunities to sub for 
group fitness class instructors may be available. Salary starts at $24/hour and 
increases based on class and packages offered. 
 
ABOUT US:  The Tinley Park-Park District is an award-winning public agency that 
provides its 55,000 residents with a wide variety of recreation facilities, programs, 
events, parks, and open spaces.  The Park District maintains over 40 parks, 33 ball 
fields, and several facilities which include the Tony Bettenhausen Recreation Center, 
White Water Canyon Water Park, Canine Campus Dog Park, Tinley Junction 
Miniature Golf & Batting Cages, Vogt Visual Arts Center, and the Tinley Park 
Performing Arts Center. 
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